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STUDENT ACCOUNT AGREEMENT 

Student Name 
Grade 
School 

I also understand the District Internet System and Technology Services are not merely a Stockton 
Unified School District Internet System where only students and teachers have access.  Rather, 
the District Internet System and Technology Services are also available to all educational 
organizations, their employees, and any organization that contributes, or may contribute, to the 
Internet Service Provider.  Further, there is an ability for guest users both minors and adults, to 
have access to the Internet System and Technology and currently there is no definition of who 
may be a guest. 

I have read the Stockton Unified School District Acceptable Use Policy and the acceptable use 
policy of the Internet service provider.  I agree to follow the rules contained in these policies. I 
understand that if I violate the rules my account can be terminated and I may face other 
disciplinary measures. 

Student Signature 
Date 

 

Parent or Guardian Section 

I have read the District Acceptable Use Policy and the attached description of services and 
acceptable use policy of the Internet service provider.  

I also understand the District Internet System and Technology Services are not merely a Stockton 
Unified School District Internet System where only students and teachers have access.  Rather, 
the District Internet System and Technology Services are also available to all educational 
organizations, their employees, and any organization that contributes, or may contribute, to the 
Internet Service Provider.  Further, there is an ability for guest users both minors and adults, to 
have access to the District Internet System and Technology Services and currently there is no 
definition of who may be a guest. 
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I hereby agree to RELEASE the District and its officers, employees, representatives, and any 
institutions with which it is affiliated, from any and all claims or damages of any kind 
whatsoever arising form my child’s use of, or inability to use, the District’s Internet System and 
Technology Services, Internet software, and services provided by the Internet service provider, 
including but not limited to, claims that may arise from the unauthorized use of they system to 
offer, provide, or purchase products or services. 

I hereby agree to RELEASE the District and its officers, employees, representatives, and any 
institutions with which it is affiliated, from any claims regarding injury to my child, including 
claims for NEGLIGENCE, however caused, arising from or in connection with my child’s use of 
the District’s Internet System and Technology Services, and through it, any Internet software and 
services provided by the Internet service provider.  

I agree to INDEMNIFY, DEFEND and HOLD HARMLESS the District and its officers, 
employees and representatives, and any institutions with which it is affiliated, from and against 
any and all claims for damage or injury caused by or related to my child’s willful and/or 
intentional violations of the provisions of the District’s Acceptable Use Policy and the attached 
acceptable use policy of the Internet service provider. 

I will instruct my child regarding restrictions against accessing material that are in addition to the 
restrictions set forth in the District’s Acceptable Use Policy and the Internet service provider’s 
acceptable use policy.  I will emphasize to my child the importance of following the rules of 
personal safety. 

I give permission for my child to access the District’s Internet System and Technology Services 
and the services provided by the Internet service provider. 

I certify that the information contained in this form is correct. 


